

RIVERBANKS
ZOO AND GARDEN

Procurement Services
400 Rivermont Drive, Columbia, SC 29210
Phone: 803-602-0831 Fax: 803-771-8722

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF **INTENT TO AWARD** AND BECOMES THE OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON RICHLAND-LEXINGTON RIVERBANKS PARK DISTRICT APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED.

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER: B15003-10/9/14

PROCUREMENT: Riverbanks Zoo Aquarium & Reptile Complex

ISSUE DATE: September 16, 2014

CLOSING DATE: October 9, 2014

AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING:

Mashburn Construction

Base Bid- \$241,559.00

Alternate #2-\$4,975.00

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract shall protest to the Procurement Officer in writing within seven (7) calendar days of the date of Intent to Award notice. Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing where the District failed in determining the potential award.



Jo Marie Brown, CPPO, CPPB
Procurement Manager

Posted: October 14, 2014



BID TAB

**AQUARIUM AND REPTILE COMPLEX RENOVATIONS
RIVERBANKS ZOO AND GARDEN**

JUMPER CARTER SEASE/ARCHITECTS. P.A.

October 9, 2014

COMMISSION NO. 13003D

CONTRACTOR	BID BOND	CERTIFICATE OF FAMILIARITY	ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED			BASE BID AMOUNT	ALTERNATE #1 - ADD Work in Space 109	ALTERNATE #2 - ADD Electrostatic Painting	Notes
			#1	#2	#3				
Callaway Construction Co.						NO BID			
Conley Construction						NO BID			
Contract Building Services						NO BID			
Contract Construction Co., Inc.						NO BID			
J P Smith Builders						NO BID			
Mashburn Construction Co., Inc.	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	\$241,559.00	\$9,199.00	\$4,975.00	
North Lake Construction Co., Inc.	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	\$265,000.00	\$17,500.00	\$16,000.00	
Pyramid Contracting, LLC	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	\$288,000.00	\$18,500.00	\$9,900.00	
Solid Structures						NO BID			
Weber, Inc.						NO BID			
W T Murphy Construction, LLC	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	\$295,345.00	\$25,457.00	\$5,754.00	
Henley's Construction Co., Inc.	✓	x	✓	✓	✓	\$267,186.00	\$10,475.00	\$12,480.00	

Certified by: *Sarah Helmer*

